Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 12:16 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SMP 287B DOA : 13/08/24

From: Vivien Ong <vianong@ymail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 12:15:41 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SMP 287B DOA : 13/08/24

Accept.thank you

Yahoo Mail: Search, organise, conquer

On Tue, 1 Oct 2024 at 3:52 pm, Rasul (LKKAuto)
<Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Vivien,
As per my message to your boss,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S of $2,700.00 /- with 04 days of repair before GST, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.



