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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 14 October 2024 8:50 AM
To: Sam San Joi   UBI
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: finalize SLU448P & photos

Hi Sam, 
 
ECICS had already approve. 
 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $31,054.35  /- with 14 days of repair before GST, subject to 
their approval. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 2:04 pm 
To: Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam@borneomotors.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fw: finalize SLU448P & photos  
  
Hi Sam, 
 
For ECICS, repair cost more than 6K required to seek approval. 
 
Aside to Veron, Kindly seek approval. 
 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam@borneomotors.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 2 October 2024 9:04 am 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: finalize SLU448P & photos  
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