Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 August 2024 10:04 AM

To: CHARMAINE KONG

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Yan (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: 50116312 / SHA8617T / TP YP7203E / 19/08/2024 - ARRANGE SURVEY *** LKK REF:
CD/LPC24080293/Rua3

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

. TP estimated cost of repair
J Preliminary advice
J Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please note that our officer in charge is Yan.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 2:03 PM

To: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>; Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: 50116312 / SHA8617T / TP YP7203E / 19/08/2024 - ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Charmaine,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.



Best Regards,
Hueh Yin | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@|onpac.com>

Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 1:52 PM

To: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: 50116312 / SHA8617T / TP YP7203E / 19/08/2024 - ARRANGE SURVEY

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Our insured had not filed the report.

We will be appointing LKK for the survey.
Aside to LKK, FYNA please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong

Claims Officer | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all TN lonpac

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



From: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 12:06 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>

Cc: claims@dingautomotive.com; Kelly Ding <kelly@dingautomotive.com>; sarah@dingautomotive.com
Subject: 50116312 / SHA8617T / TP YP7203E / 19/08/2024 - ARRANGE SURVEY

Without Prejudice

Hi Sir/Madam,

Kindly assist to arrange survey for vehicle SHA8617T at 31 Corporation Road.

GIA Report will be sent shortly.

Please avoid visiting during 12PM — 1PM.

Thank You

Best Regards,

WET

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp : 96891857

Office : 62657130

Attendee panel closed
TMIS REF: NS-M2401950 RE: Reminder for Survey: 50115980 / SHB2233B / TP SNN7326U / 04/04/2024 -
ARRANGE SURVEY

50115620 / SHC62K / TP GBF2676G / 21/11/2023 - ARRANGE SURVEY



This emailis confidential and may also be privileged. If this email has been sent to you in error, please
delete it immediately and notify us. Please do not copy, distribute, or disseminate part or whole of this
email if you are not the intended recipient or if you have not been authorized to do so. We reserve the
right, to the extent and under circumstances permitted by applicable laws, to retain, monitor, and
intercept email messages to and from our systems. Thank you.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



