Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2024 11:34 AM

To: Gabriel Wee; Motor Claim - Il

Cc: Admin A; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - SURVEY TP CLAIM: SLU6623K // GBJ810C - 13/08/24 *** LKK REF:

CD/11124080281/Uma3

Hi Gabriel,
We will bill as survey done.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 11:33 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - SURVEY TP CLAIM: SLU6623K // GBJ810C - 13/08/24 *** LKK REF: CD/11124080281/Uma3

Dear Mei Kwan,

You will close your file at your end? Will there be any billing?

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 11:29 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - SURVEY TP CLAIM: SLU6623K // GBJ810C - 13/08/24 *** LKK REF: CD/11124080281/Uma3
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Dear Sir / Madam,
MS reached. Please see attached MS form.
We will submit WP report for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 10:17 AM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - SURVEY TP CLAIM: SLU6623K // GBJ810C - 13/08/24

Dear Jacelyn,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Hueh Yin | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 9:51 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: junteo@dacc.com.sg; poon@dacc.com.sg; 'Randell Goon' <randellgoon@dacc.com.sg>; 'Siew Ying'

<siewying@dacc.com.sg>; 'DACC Mahirah' <mahirah@dacc.com.sg>; 'choonxiang@dacc.com.sg'

<choonxiang@dacc.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - SURVEY TP CLAIM: SLU6623K // GBJ810C - 13/08/24

Dear Surveyor,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLU6623K and let us have your report urgently.




