Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)

From: AIM Admin Support <automim.ops@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2024 10:14 AM

To: SUR; assignments

Subject: Re: PRI Request 07.06.2024 || C10029841/MC || RE: accident involving

SMQ6537K/SNF1502P on 5/6/24

Dear LKK,

Please arrange survey on Friday (14/06/2024) 10am.

Regards,
YokeTeng

°E

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd
Address: 3021A Ubi Road 1 #01-42 Singapore 408715

Tel: 9119 8371 www.aimgarage.com.sg

On Fri, Jun 7, 2024 at 5:49 PM AIM Admin Support <automim.ops@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi

Please arrange LKK for PRI.

Regards,

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd
Address: 3021A Ubi Road 1 #01-42 Singapore 408715

Tel: 9119 8371 www.aimgarage.com.sg

On Fri, Jun 7, 2024 at 4:50 PM Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,



Please find the list of our proposed surveyors.

1. FTA
2. A-PAC
3. LKK

Kindly let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Michael

Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3704
F +65 6725 0853

E jinghou.chin@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose

B“dgﬂt Platinum Trusted
DlrEct Service Award
insurance - feefo

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199



190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre

Singapore
239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: AIM Admin Support <automim.ops@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, June 7, 2024 4:41 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Subject: NOA - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMQ6537K & SNF1502P (A&G), DOA: 06/06/2024

Hi Office in charge

CLAIMANT: GE YONG (OWNER OF SMQ6537K)

3



We are appointed by the above mentioned claimant to notify you of the above road accident along
AYE involving your Insured's vehicle SNF1502P.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within two (2) working days of your receipt of this notice
whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply
from you within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further
reference to you.

Regards,

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd

Address: 3021A Ubi Road 1 #01-42 Singapore 408715

Tel: 9119 8371 www.aimgarage.com.sg




