Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Sir,

Refer to above matter

Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Monday, 23 September 2024 12:57 PM

'sieying@mova.com.sg'

leongkeat.soo@mova.com.sg; nitha@mova.com.sg; Admin A

RE: TP CLAIMS - SLN3455K & SLQ3296L ON 21/07/2024 *** LKK REF:
CD/11124080232/RMA3

Please be informed that our principal M/s India International Insurance Pte Ltd. had repudiated the claim due
insured to breach in policy terms & conditions. Please redirect claim to the insured.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: sieying@mova.com.sg <sieying@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2024 11:17 AM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

Cc: leongkeat.soo@mova.com.sg; nitha@mova.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: TP CLAIMS - SLN3455K & SLQ3296L ON 21/07/2024 *** LKK REF:

CD/11124080232/RMA3

Dear Daphne,

Can we have an update on the liability.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

sleying

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Blk 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-04/06/08

Singapore 159722

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o o

Automolive Ple Ltd



Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 3:14 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SLN3455K & SLQ3296L ON

21/07/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/11124080232/RMA3

Dear Mei Kwan,

We have repudiated the policy. Please get TP to forward their claim towards our insured.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

NDIA

=) . | lNTERNATlONAL
INSURANCE
§ I NGAPORE
. Serving ihe region since T987
6 Raffles Quay, #22 -00

Singapore 048580
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Gabriel Wee

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2024 2:25 pm

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Edmund Law <Edmund.Law@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ***SPAM*** RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SLN3455K & SLQ3296L ON 21/07/2024 *** LKK REF:
CD/11124080232/RMA3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Insured has not reported. We will repudiate the policy.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

NDIA

=) . | lNTERNATlONAL
INSURANCE
§ I NGAPORE
. Serving ihe region since T987
6 Raffles Quay, #22 -00

Singapore 048580
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248




