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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 September 2024 10:41 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALIZE FOR SMA6369M-T.PRIUS- ACCIDENT ON 09/08/2024

Hi All, 
we confirm COR LS $7,000/- with 7 days of repair 
 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Ms Hong 
MG Solution Pte Ltd  
E: mg3solution@gmail.com 
T: 6744 4986 / 6744 4165   
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #04-01 Singapore 415933 
 
On Tue, Sep 10, 2024 at 9:44 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Hong, 

  

“Without Prejudice”  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $7,000/- with 7 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 3 September 2024 3:01 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALIZE FOR SMA6369M-T.PRIUS- ACCIDENT ON 09/08/2024 

  

add after repair photo 

  

  

On Tue, Sep 3, 2024 at 3:00 PM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi All, 

Please refer to the attached and confirmed finalised amount and days with us. 

Please see the attached file After Repair Photo  for your reference. 

  

 
 

Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
  
Ms Hong 
MG Solution Pte Ltd  
E: mg3solution@gmail.com 
T: 6744 4986 / 6744 4165   
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #04-01 Singapore 415933 


