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Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2024 11:12 AM
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong; Joanne Tan Jo Ann; assignments
Subject: RE: New Assignment (Our Ref: D24007004MFCT/CCPL)

Dear Joanne, 
 
Noted with thanks. 
 
No survey was done for this vehicle. 
 
We will close this file at our end without billing. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 11:25 PM 
To: 88 Motorz SG <motorclaims88sg@gmail.com>; Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Alvin Tan 
<alvintan88claims@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (Our Ref: D24007004MFCT/CCPL) 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Thank you, the update. 
 
Dear LKK Auto, 
 
Pls cancel the assignment. 
 
 
 
Thanks, and regards, 
 
 
Joanne Yong 
Motor Claims 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | TEL: 6359 
1823 | Fax No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

  
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. 
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
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Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. 
If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: 88 Motorz SG <motorclaims88sg@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 6:18 PM 
To: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 
Alvin Tan <alvintan88claims@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: New Assignment (Our Ref: D24007004MFCT/CCPL) 
 

Dear Joanna, 

This case my client has private settled with the taxi. Please do not come down for this case. 

Ryan Ho 

 
On Tue, 13 Aug 2024, 14:50 Joanne Tan Jo Ann, <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Mdm,  
  
Attached documents for survey assignment. 
  

  

-----Original Message----- 
From: support@msfirstcapital.com.sg <support@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 2:42 PM 
To: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: MT00017895 is Approved 

  

  

Insured Vehicle No : SHC0268J 

TP Vehicle No      : SNB6129Y 

Claim No           : D24007004MFCT 

Workshop Name      : 88 MOTORZ PTE LTD 

Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

Instructions       : Without Prejudice 

Non reporting 

Created By         : JOANNTAN 
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Verified By        : JOANNEYO 

Approved By        : JOANNEYO 

  

  

  

This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 

  

  

  

 
 
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: 88 Motorz SG <motorclaims88sg@gmail.com> 
To: Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Bcc:  
Date: Mon, 12 Aug 2024 10:13:48 +0000 
Subject: Re: D24007004MFCT Direct Settlement for SNB6129Y MG HS YOUR REF: SHC268J PRE 
REPAIR INSPECTION Accident DATE: 12/08/2024 09:55 (SGT) 
Dear Joanne,  
 
Attached is the GIA report. Estimate is in the process of completing. By then time of PRI it will be 
ready. 
 
Ryan Ho 
 
On Mon, Aug 12, 2024 at 5:56 PM Joanne Yong Lai Fong <JoanneYong@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sir, 

Refer to the above matter. 

PLs kindly forward your client’s GIA report and estimate. 

Meanwhile we would like to inform you that our insured not yet report the accident. 

Thanks, and regards, 

Joanne Yong 
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Motor Claims 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | TEL: 6359 
1823 | Fax No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. 

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. 

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 

From: 88 Motorz SG <motorclaims88sg@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, August 12, 2024 5:29 PM 
To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: Direct Settlement for SNB6129Y MG HS YOUR REF: SHC268J PRE REPAIR INSPECTION Accident DATE: 
12/08/2024 09:55 (SGT) 

Dear Claims Department, 

Please find below for details: 

Survey Type : 

(Please indicate New or Resurvey) 
NEW  

Vehicle to be surveyed : SNB6129Y MG HS 

Your Insured Vehicle : SHC268J 

Date of Accident : 12/08/2024 09:55 (SGT) 

Date of Survey : To Be Arranged 

Name of Workshop : 88 Motorz (SG) Pte Ltd  

Address of Survey Location : Bartley Biz Centre, 15 Kaki Bukit Rd 4 #01-46 S417808 

Name of Contact Person :  Alvin Tan  

Contact Number : 91038536  

Any Undercarriage involved : 

NO 

 

--  

Warmest regards, 

Ryan Ho 

Claims Dept 
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88 Motorz (SG) Pte Ltd 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that  
the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Email Confidentiality Warning: 

This message may contain information which are trade secret and/or is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any UN-
authorized disclosure, copying, distribution or use of this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us by e-
mailing us at [ryanho@88motorz.com] and delete it from your system. You should scan this email and any file attached for viruses. We take no 
responsibility for any loss or damage, whether caused by our own negligence or not, that results from a computer virus or a defect in the transmission of 
this email or any attached file. 

 
 
 
--  
Warmest regards,  
 
Claims Dept 
88 Motorz (SG) Pte Ltd 

 
Email Confidentiality Warning: 
This message may contain information which are trade secret and/or is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any UN-
authorized disclosure, copying, distribution or use of this information is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us by e-
mailing us at [ryanho@88motorz.com] and delete it from your system. You should scan this email and any file attached for viruses. We take no 
responsibility for any loss or damage, whether caused by our own negligence or not, that results from a computer virus or a defect in the transmission of 
this email or any attached file. 


