Rajes (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Tuesday, August 13, 2024 2:50 PM

assignments; Admin A

88 Motorz SG; Joanne Yong Lai Fong; Alvin Tan

New Assignment (Our Ref: D24007004MFCT/CCPL)

Re: D24007004MFCT Direct Settlement for SNB6129Y MG HS YOUR REF: SHC268)
PRE REPAIR INSPECTION Accident DATE: 12/08/2024 09:55 (SGT); 9a. Jobsheet.pdf

Attached documents for survey assignment.

----- Original Message-----

From: support@msfirstcapital.com.sg <support@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 2:42 PM

To: Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: MT00017895 is Approved

Insured Vehicle No : SHC0268)

TP Vehicle No  :SNB6129Y

Claim No : D24007004MFCT

Workshop Name :88 MOTORZ PTE LTD

Our Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Instructions : Without Prejudice

Non reporting

Created By : JOANNTAN

Verified By : JOANNEYO

Approved By : JOANNEYO
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