Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING <2020spraypainting@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 28 November 2024 3:48 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SNL6143C-DOA:07/08/2024

Dear Huey Yon,

We hereby accept the proposed finalisation on repairs as per the above. Please proceed accordingly.
Thank you.

Regards,
SHAH.

On Thu, 28 Nov 2024, 15:43 Huey Yon (LKKAuto), <hueyyon®@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Without prejudice

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $2,600.00 with 4 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933



