Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2024 4:02 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SKT 2045Y DOA : 07/08/24

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2024 4:01:59 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKT 2045Y DOA : 07/08/24

Dear Rasul,
Accept. Thanks
Get Outlook for iOS

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2024 10:18:45 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKT 2045Y DOA : 07/08/24

Hi Chris,

As per our message,

Liberty had approved the finalise amount of $2,600/3 days of lump sum repair.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $2,600.00 /- with 03 days of repair before GST.
Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-



